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Seminar paper from the year 2006 in the subject American Studies - Literature, grade: 2,3, University of
Regensburg (Institut for American Studies), course: American Literatur in the 20th century, 15 entries in the
bibliography, language: English, abstract: “Long before ‘America’ became a country, it was a continent, and
long before it was known to exist as a continent, it was a vision and a dream” (Freese 78). This vision or
dream has often been discussed by modernist writers such as F. Scott Fitzgerald. Fitzgerald’sThe Great
Gatsbyis a novel about the unconditional love of the self-made man Jay Gatsby to a woman that personifies
for him true love, success and the ultimate possession. Yet one of the major themes of his masterpiece is not
a disenchanting love relationship, but rather the decline and the corruption of the American Dream. In his
novel old values that once gave substance and hope to the Dream have been replaced by immoral and
decadent pursuits and virtues, which have eventually corrupted the venerable idea of the American Dream.
“TheGreat Gatsby,we are told, is not simply a chronicle of the Jazz Age but rather a dramatization of the
betrayal of the naive American Dream in a corrupt society” (Ornstein 54). It is the thesis of this paper
thatThe Great Gatsbyis a comment on the corruption of the American Dream in the Jazz Age of the 1920s,
which can be particularly observed in the characters Jordan Baker, Tom and Daisy Buchanan and Jay
Gatsby. A short overview of the main assumptions and characteristics of the American Dream will follow the
introduction, in particular taking into account Benjamin Franklin’s ideas on how to achieve success and
wealth in the American society and discussing his proposed thirteen virtues in the Poor Richard’s Almanack.
Additionally the main ideas that constitute the American dream will be introduced and highlighted. In the
third part of the paper these main ideas and Franklin’s recipe for success will be applied toThe Great
Gatsbyand its characters. Here it will be essential to see, to which extent the characters mentioned above
comply with the main ideas and characteristics that compose the idea of the American Dream and its way to
success and wealth. Lastly, the conclusion will highlight the results and will prove the thesis, which was
raised.
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From reader reviews:

Tony Hill:

With other case, little folks like to read book The Great Gatsby and the American Dream. You can choose
the best book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important any book The Great
Gatsby and the American Dream. You can add information and of course you can around the world by a
book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can understand everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize
it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Claudia Weidner:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored
faster. And you have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need
to answer that question because just their can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on guardería until university need this specific The Great Gatsby
and the American Dream to read.

Ian Louviere:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book you
can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The The Great Gatsby and the American Dream provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Ryan Connors:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this The Great Gatsby and the American Dream can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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