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The Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV Edition has a unique color-coding system that allows readers to
identify quickly and easily twelve major themes of Scripture throughout the text: God, discipleship, love,
faith, sin, evil, salvation, family, outreach, commandments, history, and prophecy. The system also
underlines all words directly spoken b God, Jesus, and the Holy Spirit. Other features of this Bible include 12
pages of color maps with index, a Bible reading calendar, concordance, subject guide, Table of Weights and
Measures, "Know What God Says," "100 Popular Passages," and "365 Popular Bible Quotations for
Memorization and Meditation."
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From reader reviews:

Harry Crawford:

This Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV Edition, Brown/Pink LeatherTouch is great publication for you
because the content which is full of information for you who always deal with world and possess to make
decision every minute. This book reveal it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can say no
rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides straight forward sentences but challenging core information with attractive delivering
sentences. Having Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV Edition, Brown/Pink LeatherTouch in your hand like
getting the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer
you world within ten or fifteen small right but this guide already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey
Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?

Sheila Powell:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Holman Rainbow Study Bible:
KJV Edition, Brown/Pink LeatherTouch which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
notice.

Larry Moore:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or real their
hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful images on
there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this period, many
ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this
Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV Edition, Brown/Pink LeatherTouch can make you sense more interested
to read.

Eric Hodges:

Many people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV
Edition, Brown/Pink LeatherTouch to make your reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading
expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study it
and mingle the opinion about book and reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to start a
book and learn it. Beside that the guide Holman Rainbow Study Bible: KJV Edition, Brown/Pink



LeatherTouch can to be your brand-new friend when you're sense alone and confuse using what must you're
doing of their time.
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